ROADS AUTHORITY
Private Bag 12030
Ausspannplatz
Windhoek

NAMIBIA

SAFE ROADS TO PROSPERITY

NOTICE OF AWARD

BID REFERENCE NO: W/ONB/RA-20/2023: ROUTINE MAINTENANCE OF
CONCRETE AND STEEL ROADS STRUCTURE IN THE //KARAS REGION
(KARASBURG-MARIENTAL AREA)

Award Date Company/Entity Awarded Awarded Amount
19 March 2024 Geckoh Fifty-Eight Investment Group (Pty) | N$ 14 599 862.77
Ltd (Inclusive of VAT).
% ] }\

Established in terms of the Roads Authority Act, 1999 (Act 17 of 1999)
Board of Directors: Ms L. Brandt (Chairperson), Mr P. Muluti (Deputy Chairperson), Ms H. Amupolo, Mr T. Hamalta,
Mr G. Kadhikwa, Mr P, Greeff, Dr. G. Tshoopara




SAFE ROADS TO PROSPERITY

ROADS AUTHORITY

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY OF BID EVALUATION
REPORT

ROUTINE MAINTENANCE OF CONCRETE AND STEEL ROAD
STRUCTURES IN THE //KARAS REGION (KARASBURG-
MARIENTAL AREA)

Procurement Reference No: W/ONB/RA-20/2023



A

Executive Summary of Bid Evaluation Report

ROUTINE MAINTENANCE OF CONCRETE AND STEEL ROAD STRUCTURES IN
THE //KARAS REGION (KARASBURG-MARIENTAL AREA)
W/ONB/RA-20/2023

Scope of Contract: Routine Maintenance of Concrete and Steel Road Structures in the
//Karas Region (Karasburg-Mariental Area)

Procurement method used: Open National Bidding

Date of Invitation of Bids: 01 August 2023

Closing date for submission of bids: 06 October 2023

Date and place of opening of bids: 06 October 2023, Roads Authority Head Office,
Windhoek

Number of bids received by closing date: 39

Responsiveness of bids:



Pricing at Bid

Bl;:er Bidder Name Opening in N§ R((;;gs(;rll\?:)\;e Reasons why bid is not responsive
(incl. VAT)
1 Zero Six Five No Bid submission form not duly filled in, Total bid price
Trading cc 15,694,429.50 after discount indicated as N/A
Alugodhi
2 Eg%g?j;'t?ogn& 17,923,882.75 No Bidder's standard score is not between -1.0 and 1.0
cc
3 VoKar No Bidder’s standard score is not between -1.0 and 1.0
Investment cc | 17,246,664.00 ) '
4 Caldera No - Bid submission form not duly filled in. Total bid
Investments cc | 18,177,489.25 rice after discount entered as zero (0).
Junar Trading - B?d Submission form not §igqed.
5 cc 13.802 083.00 No - Bidder submitted wrong bidding document
SR - No Offered bid validity
- Does not meet the requirement of 3 year's
specific experience as per ITB 6.2¢) (Total number
6 Mendozer No of contracts of similar nature to add up to three (3)
Investments ¢c | 11,802,083.00 years over the- last 10-years))
- Consent letter not according to ITB 6.2e) Letter
has no Bid Ref number.
Larissa
: Investments cc | 15,531,766.60 Yes N/A
Mindpower
Investment JV
8 | Omupondo 15,617,310.50 | Y8
Construction
cc N/A
-No fitness certificate, no lease agreement and no
municipal bill as required by BDS Clause 6.2 (a)
- No asset register as required by ITB 6.2 d).
. Rouwans N - Cor_'ltrzc; rr}_arréagezr q)ualifications not certified as
0 required by 2e
Investments cc | 15,256,348.50 - Foreman Vocational certificate & ID is a copy of
certified copy thus not fulfilling ITB 6.2 )
Only submitted 2 years of statements. Do not meet
ITB 6.2 g).
10 Lau Tom cc No Mo?or ve_hicle Iic.;e.n.se disk and Certificate of
15,726,365.00 registration not initialed
Social Security Good Standing certificate not
11 Goreseb No initialed
Trading cc 15,911,590.90 Social Security Certificate not initialed
Page 3 of the Progress report not initialed.
FN Group of
12 Companies No Bid submission form not duly filled in.
(PTY) Ltd 18,826,874.25
Ondjove
Trading JV
13| Ndahomwena | 16,453,593.81 Ne

Enterprises cc

SME Certificate not initialed




Pricing at Bid

Bl;ger Bidder Name Opening in N§ R(i?gs(;[;\?:)‘;e Reasons why bid is not responsive
(incl. VAT)
Pelico
14 Engineering Yes N/A
Group 15,668,950.70
- Value of works is less than N$8,000,000.00 as per
ITB6.2¢
- Completion certificates do not have specified
INN contract duration. Therefore ITB 6.2 c) not fulfilled.
15 Investments cc | 16.012 496,50 No - No letter of lease for the 7-ton truck as indicated
S for intent to lease on asset register. ITB 6.2 d)
- Contracts manager does not have the 3 years
relevant experience in similar projects as per ITB
6.2¢e)
James & ; . ) . .
) Bid submission form not duly filled in. Total bid price
1s \E(oung Tradmg 16,609,432.50 O after discounts is indicated as N/A
nterprises cc
- Completion certificates do not have specified

17 Royal No contract duration. Therefore, ITB 6.2 c) not satisfied

Contractors cc | 17,748,756.78 - Does not have 5 years’ experience as a foreman
in similar projects. as per ITB 6.2 e)
PMPH & . . -

18 Constructions No Evidentiary proof of total s[mllar contracts does not
= 15,497,515.00 amount to 3 years as required by ITB 6.2 c).
Ndinependa

19 Trading No
Enterprises cc 1515218, Sre02 Notice No. 03 page 1- 7 to bidders not initialed
KAl - Did not submit book of supporting documents

20 Engineering & | 0.0 No - No company reglst.ratlon submitted, members
Fabrication could not be determined.

- No power of attorney
21 | NestTradng | 4604976110 | Yes |NA
- Evidentiary proof of total similar contracts does not
Wynnic Plant amount to 3 years as required by ITB 6.2 ¢).

22 Hire & No - Contracts managers qualification is a copy
Construction 16,321,219.75 extracted from a certified copy. Not fulfiling ITB
cc 6.2e).

- No specified Forman under provided personnel
- Evidentiary proof of total similar contracts does not

23 Niilotse No amount to 3 years as required by ITB 6.2 c).
Investments cc | 17,201,470.00 - Foremen does not meet the 5 years’ experience

as per ITB 6.3d).

24 Florida No Foreman does not have 5 years’ experience as
Trading cc 15,727,285.00 required by ITB 6.2¢).

o5 Potenza No - Bid submission form not duly filled in.

Investments cc

17,926,369.55

- Total Bid price indicated as N/A

s




Pricing at Bid

Blgger Bidder Name Opening in N§ Iti?g;;'g:;e Reasons why bid is not responsive
(incl. VAT)
- FNB letter of intent not initialed,
Baobab - Okakango general dealer reference letter not
26 Trading No initialed,
Enterprises cc 15,825,196.00 - Site Agent driver’s license not initialed. As per ITB
21.2
- The bidder completion certificates were not issued
Topaz by the main contractors not from a
Construction client/employer/consultant as required by ITB 6.2 C)
27 and 17,064,538.50 No - Asset register does not have a concrete porker as
Engineering required by ITB 6.2 d).
(PTY) Ltd - Contracts manager only has a National Diploma,
which do not satisfy ITB 6.2e)
RA -Member David Itula did not give power of attorney
8 Investments cc No and no consent for joint venture given. JV
JV Gongaleni 15,631,789.60 Agreement does not meet evaluation criteria 7. (a)
Investments cc of Legal Admissibility
Namshine - _Bid Submission form not duly filled in. Total after
29 Investments cc | 17.895.162.00 No discounts bid price left blank
) ’ ) - Bid validity period blank
- Bid Submission form not duly filled in. Total after
discounts bid price left blank
- Bid Submission in book of supporting in entered
30 Flame No N/A.
Investments cc | 16,266,740.33 - SME Contractor training course certificate not
initialed
- ID copy of Company Director (NL Amupanda) not
initialed as per ITB 21.2
Smek Trading
31 Enterprises JV No JV agreement does not state requirement (iv)
Tulu Trading 16,739,797.90 Partners are jointly and severely liable
cC
Danny’s
30 Building No Bid Submission form not duly filled in. Total amount
Construction 15,642,438.00 after discounts left blank
cc
Geckoh Fifty
Eight
3| jvestments | 1553176800 | YeS | NA
(PTY) Ltd
Pices
34 Investments No
Holdings No. 8 | 16,796,942.21 Bid Submission form not duly filled in. Total amount
cc after discount left blank
- Contracts Manager does not meet the 3 years
required specific experience 6.2 c).
Omhanggla - l\cl]o specified Foremen Form PEI%—1: Prosed
35 Constructions | 13,091,128.50 No
ce personnel. General foreman does not meet the 5

years’ specific experience as per ITB 6.3d). Does
not have artisanal qualification

WA




Bidder Pricing at Bid Responsive
No Bidder Name Opening in N$ (Yp s/ No) Reasons why bid is not responsive
(incl. VAT) €
Oshikoto
36 Building No Foremen does not meet the 5 years’ specific
Construction 16,272,442.50 experience as per ITB 6.3d).
cc
Ramamor Thomas S Shambo CV not initialed by authorized
37 Construction 19 155.185.22 No person as per Power of Attorney
cc . Bid Validity offered as 90 days in bidding document.
18 Sumseng 12,163,786.90 No Bid Sulbmlssmn form not duly filled in. Total amount
Contracting cc after discounts Zero
39 Vidu Traading No Bid Submission form not duly filled in. Total amount
cc 14,774,691.13 after discounts indicated as N/A

8. Price comparison for bids that are substantially responsive:

Price after P " |
rice after a in
Price at Bid Adjustments pplyine
Bidder margin of
Name Opening N$ after Arithmetic Rank
No Preference
(including VAT) correction N$
(including VAT)
(Including VAT)
Geckoh Fifty Eight
33 15,531,768.90 N/A 14,599,862.77 1
Investments Group (Pty) Ltd
8 Mindpower Investment cc JV 15,617,310.50 N/A 14,680,271.87 2
Omupondo Construction cc
7 Larrisa Investment cc 15,531,766.60 N/A 15,065,813.60 3
21 West Trading cc 16,049,761.10 N/A 15,086,775.43 4
14 Pelico Engineering Group cc 15,860,845.77 15,568,950.70 15,101,882.18 5
9. Best Evaluated Bid:
Bidder No. 33: Geckoh Fifty Eight Investments Group (Pty) Ltd with a bid price of N$ 15,531,768.90, is
recommended for award of this bid.
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